Charlotte County Board Of County Commissioners

Agenda Item Summary
Item Number: F-7

1 DEPARTMENT MAKING REQUEST 2 MEETING DATE
Purchasing 10/14/2014 9:00:00 AM

3 REQUESTED MOTION/ACTION

Rescind award of line item #10, Reward, for Bid #14-308, Insecticides & Herbicides - Supply and Deliver
from Crop Production Services Inc. of Mulberry, FL; and award to Winfield Solutions of Plant City, FL, at
the unit price of $100 per gallon. Approval is for the period from date of award through and including May
31, 2015.

4 AGENDA 5 IS THIS ITEM BUDGETED ( IF APPLICABLE) - Yes

Consent Budget Action
No action needed. Funding from the Mosquito Control Department budget
approved in the FY15 budget process. Funding is supplied from general
revenues.

Financial Impact Summary Statement
Funding is supplied from general revenues.
Detailed Analysis Attached - No

Budget Officer-
BACKGROUND ( Why is this Action Necessary, and What Action will be

6 .
accomplished)
This is an annual contract to purchase insecticides and herbicides, to be utilized on an "as required" basis
by the Public Works-Pest Management Division which the Board approved on July 22, 2014. It was
discovered after the award the Crop Production Services made an error in one of their line items, line
item #10, Reward, and are unable to honor the prices of $30.90 per gallon. Therefore, staff recommends
rescinding award to Crop Production and awarding Line Item #10, Reward, to Winfield Solutions of Plant
City, FL, at the unit cost of $100 per gallon. This unit price is in line with the other bids received for this
item.
ATTACHMENTS:
Name: Description: Type:
[ 114308 Insecticides HerbicidesCO Recomm.pdf Bid Tabulation Backu.p
Material
[ 114-308_Submittal-Crop.pdf Submittal-Crop Prod Backu_p
Material
| 114-308 Submittal-Winfield.pdf 14-308 Submittal Winfield Backup

Material
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CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
BID TABULATION

INSECTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY & DELIVER
BID NO. 2014000308

BID OPENING DATE: 05/28/14

DEPT: Public Works-Pest Division

HPI Products Inc. GIL

d/b/a All Pro Vector Red River Manufacturing Upstart Helena
Company Name: Group Specialities, Inc. Adapco Inc. Inc. Products Inc. Chemical Co.
Location Northville, Ml Shreveport, LA | Sanford, FL | Montgomery, AL| Titusville, FL Dade City, FL
Description Unit
Dibrom Concentrate gallon NO BID NO BID $ 180.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Altosid Briguets — 150 Day case NO BID NO BID $ 682.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Altosid Liquid (5%) gallon NO BID NO BID $ 250.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
B.T.l. gallon NO BID NO BID $ 27.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Permanone 30/30 mini-tote | $ 14,913.25 NO BID $ 15,334.00 | $ 16,574.25 NO BID NO BID
Altosid Pellets 44-|b case NO BID NO BID $ 1,102.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Anvil 10/10 275g mini-tote NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Zenivex 30g contrainer NO BID NO BID $ 8,820.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Captain XTR 2.5g container NO BID $ 75.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 61.25
Reward gallon NO BID $ 108.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 103.13
Cutrine®Plus Aldaecide-Liquid 2.5g container NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 35.63
Cutrine®-Plus Aldaecide-Granular 30-Ib bag NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 50.10
Sonar AS gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,902.36
Sonar SRP 40-1b pail NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 30.14
Garlon 3A gallon NO BID $ 62.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 46.25
Foam Buster pint NO BID $ 8.97 NO BID NO BID $ 6.25| $ 6.35
Marker Dye gallon NO BID $ 17.62 NO BID NO BID $ 2750 | $ 14.56
90/10 Non-ionic Spreader/Sticker gallon NO BID $ 9.45 NO BID NO BID $ 21451 $ 13.28
Drift Control Agent gallon NO BID $ 35.78 NO BID NO BID $ 7014 | $ 27.04
Aquatic Glyphos gallon NO BID $ 20.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 18.00
Avast gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,678.10
Natular G 40 Ib bag NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular XRG 40 Ib bag NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular 2EC 2x2.5gal case NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular T30 400 tablet cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular XRT 220 tablet cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

e een M. Lindback, Contract Specialist

and

Arthur Markham, Contract Specialist
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CHARLOTTE COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS
BID TABULATION
INSECTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY & DELIVER
BID NO. 2014000308
BID OPENING DATE: 05/28/14

DEPT: Public Works-Pest Division

Clarke

Crop Production Mosquito John Deere Winfield
Company Name: Services Control VET Corp Inc. Landscapes Solutions UNIVAR USA
Location Mulberry, FL Kissimmee, FL | Frederick, MD |Port Charlotte, FL{ Plant City, FL Tampa, FL
Description Unit
Dibrom Concentrate gallon NO BID NO BID $ 110.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Altosid Briquets — 150 Day case NO BID $ 682.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 682.00
Altosid LiquidD (5%) gallon NO BID $ 250.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID 250.40
B.T.l gallon NO BID $ 28.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Permanone 30/30 mini-tote NO BID $ 26,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 16,021.50
Altosid Pellets 44-Ib case NO BID $ 1,102.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,102.20
Anvil 10/10 275g mini-tote NO BID $ 64,336.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Zenivex 30g contrainer NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8,820.00
Captain XTR 2.5g container | $ 25.92 NO BID $ 70.87 NO BID $ 70.72 NO BID
Reward gallon $ 30.90 NO BID $ 126.00 | $ 19750 | $ 100.00 197.50
Cutrine®Plus Aldaecide-Liquid 2.5g container | $ 16.60 NO BID $ 70.35 NO BID $ 53.75 NO BID
Cutrine®-Plus Aldaecide-Granular 30-lbbag | $ 1.82 NO BID $ 74.55 NO BID $ 58.20 NO BID
Sonar AS gallon $ 1,902.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,902.36 NO BID
Sonar SRP 40-b pail | $ 30.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 30.14 NO BID
Garlon 3A gallon $ 43.10 NO BID $ 5250 | $ 67.28 | $ 53.39 NO BID
Foam Buster pint $ 8.40 NO BID $ 9.45 NO BID NO BID 2.50
Marker Dye gallon $ 22.14 NO BID $ 46.20| $ 18.90( $ 28.50 34.06
90/10 Non-ionic Spreader/Sticker gallon $ 12.30 NO BID $ 1575 $ 19.26 | $ 23.00 12.64
Drift Control Agent gallon $ 12.00 NO BID $ 44.10 NO BID $ 23.00 NO BID
Aquatic Glyphos gallon $ 18.20 NO BID $ 2467 | $ 2948 | $ 19.10 21.06
Avast gallon $ 1,586.00 NO BID $ 2,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular G 40 Ib bag NO BID $ 218.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular XRG 40 Ib bag NO BID $ 612.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular 2EC 2x2.5gal case NO BID $ 4,951.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular T30 400 tablet cs NO BID $ 596.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Natular XRT 220 tablet cs NO BID $ 952.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AWARDED TO: VARIOUS COMPANIES - to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder by line item (Highlighted in yellow) .

Witnesses: Kathleen M. Lindback, Contract Specialist

and

Arthur Markham, Contract Specialist




BID FORM
PESTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY & DELIVER
BID NO. 2014000308

TO: Senior Division Manager - Purchasing
Board of County Commissioners
Charlotte County Administration Center
18500 Murdock Circle
Port Charlotte, Fl. 33948-1094

The undersigned, as bidder, does hereby declare that he has read the Request for Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Technical
Specifications & Conditions, Safety & Health Requirements, Bid Form, and any other documentation for

INSECTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY & DELIVER

and further agrees to furnish all items listed on the attached Bid Form in accordance with the unit price(s) submitted. The
above specified documents are herein incorporated into the Bid Form and shall be defined as the contract documents.

Plegée indicate by (V) that you have included the following documentation with your bid:

( Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) and Labels

( Proof of Authorized Florida Distributor: All Bidders must provide statement from manufacturer of any/all
product(s) bid, showing Bidder to be an authorized distributor within the State of Florida for said product.

{ ) Business Tax Receipt: (Only required if claiming status as a “local Business” and must be valid for at
least six (6) months prior to the bid submission)

Local Business Status: If Bidder affirms that it is a local business as defined in I1B-26 and in accordance with Ordinance
2009-005 adopted by the Charlotte County Board of Commissioners and filed with the Secretary of State on February 17,
2009, and Ordinance 2009-041 adopted by the Charlotte County Board of Commissioners and filed with the Secretary of
State on October 19, 2009, then the Affidavit Claiming Status as a Local Business, which is included as a part of this bid
package, must be completed and returned.

Yes, our business qualifies as a Local Business and has completed and attached the ‘Affidavit Claiming Status as a
Local Business’ as a part of our submission.

No, our business does not qualify as a Local Business.

NOTE: Charlotte County's official bid openings are open to the public. Citizens and submitting bidders are encouraged to
attend. However, if you are unable to attend but wish to obtain the unofficial bid results, you may do so by visiting our
website at www.charlottecountyfl.com/purchasing under “Purchasing Bids On-Line”, Document Number 143084. No
information regarding the submittal will be divulged over the telephone.

PIGGYBACK CLAUSE: It is understood and agreed by Charlotte County and the successful bidder(s) that any local
governmental entity in the County of Charlotte may purchase the materials and services specified herein in accordance
with the prices submitted by the successful bidder(s). It is also understood and agreed that each local entity will establish
its own contract with a successful bidder, place its own orders, be invoiced therefrom and make its own payments to the
successful bidder in accordance with the terms of the contract established between the local governmental entity and the
successful bidder. It is also hereby mutually understood and agreed that Charlotte County is not a legally bound party to
any contractual agreement made between a successful bidder and any local entity other than Charlotte County Board of
County Commissioners.

The bidder hereby agrees to the above stated provisions of the piggyback clause: YES x NO

NAME OF BIDDERCQOPMU—C:H;:DJO Sé&u} CES :L“uc_\

(This form to be returned)

14 Bid No. 2014000308



PRICES:

1.

10.
11.
12.
13.

NAME OF BIDDER C{;o;p EnglachisM 5&@2(6&5 I)Cd

(This form to be returned)

DIBROM CONCENTRATE

$_ _ /gallon
ALTOSID BRIQUETS - 150 Day
$ /case

ALTOSID LIQUID (5%)

$_ [gallon

B.T.l

$_ /gallon

PERMETHRIN 30/30

$ __ IMiniTote

ALTOSID PELLETS

$ /44 pound case

ANVIL 10/10

$ /275 gallon mini-tote
container

ZENIVEX

$ /30 gallon container

CAPTAIN XTR

$g§ B G /2.5 gallon container

REWARD

$3_®_,9_C)_/2.5 gallon container

CUTRINE PLUS ALGAECIDE-LIQUID

$ l 6 ﬁQ /2.5 gallon container

$ I L DA /30 pound bags

SONAR AS

$_|_0LQ&.~3_élgallon

Product Name: f\ )!L%

Package Size:

Days for Delivery:

Product Name:

I\
Package Size: \\ Days for Delivery:

Product Name:

Package Size: Days for Delivery:

Product Name: \\

Package Size: Days for Delivery:

Product Name:

Package Size: Days for Delivery:

Product Name:

Days for Delivery:

Product Name:

Days for Delivery:

Product Name: U[ \?)

Days for Delivery:

Product NameC_qp‘l—.{u- 2 XET
Days for Delivery: &‘ 2
Product Namew SPc. .l

Package Size: & ,5 (a Days for Delivery: a‘ ,3
Product Name: C1 2 ‘f‘Ql m&?luﬁ

Package Size: & v S alL Days for Delivery:S\‘
CUTRINE PLUS ALGAECIDE GRANULAR Product Name:cu:tﬁL&QBu.S_ﬁQOM&lQ.ﬂ_

Package Size: '30 “1 Days for Delivery: _&L

Product Name: Se; oar. AS

Package Size: | ci [ Days for Delivery: _a;B_

15 Bid No. 2014000308



PRICES (Continued)

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

SONAR SPR Product Name: S@mfz SRP

$ BQQ, If—_l: / pound Package Size: 4o (b Days for Deliveryza'B
GARLON 3A Product Name: E le MEJ\I'I" e A

$ E( 3 N lO /gallon Package Size: & . SGL Days for DeIivery:c%, ¢ 3
FOAM BUSTER Product Name: (A n, fbaon er_

$ O /pint Package Size: C_J[ !',4 Qn.‘j Days for Delivery'g - ,3
MARKER DYE Product Name: Tiae Thaw Blue

$ Q& ) | H /gallon Package Size: ;L . 5 &L Days for Delivery: &3_
90/10 Non-lonic Spreader/Sticker Product Name:ﬁp{ﬁﬁd_ﬁL QO

$ \& 30 /galion Package Size: & ) S “8 Days for Delivery:g ]
DRIFT CONTROL AGENT Product Name:E&L&p

$12.00 /galion Package Size:_ | (AL Days for Delivery: < =3
AQUATIC GLYPHOS Product Name?&uué UJP Cu_s{'zsm

$ l& . 9\0 /gallon Package Size: 9\ . S C’JL Days for Delivery: 2 = 5
AVAST Product Name: QLo s SC.

sl S B6. CO/gallon Package Size: | GL Days for Delivery:_ o2 =3
NATULAR G Product Name: ___A) /13

$ /40 Ib. bag Days for Delivery:

NATULAR XRG Product Name:

$ /40 Ib. bag Days for Delivery:

NATULAR 2EC Product Name:

$ /2x2.5 gal case Days for Delivery:

NATULAR T30 Product Name:

$ /400 tablet case Days for Delivery:

NATULAR XRT Product Name: |

$ /220 tablet case Days for Delivery: ) / R

NAME OF BIDDER_( E&P Mg ) g;bezou :56’;3 plCeS TL!C.
(This form to be returned)
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If notified of the acceptance of this bid form, the undersigned agrees to execute a Contract for the stated compensation in
the form as prescribed by the County, within the time constraints outlined in Instructions to Bidders.

The signature below is a guarantee that the Bidder will not withdraw his/her bid for a period of sixty (60) days after the
scheduled time for opening the bids.

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following addenda, and the cost, if any, of such revisions has been included
in the price bid.

Addendum No. , Dated ; Addendum No. , Dated : Addendum No. , Dated

Addendum No. , Dated ; Addendum No. , Dated : Addendum No. , Dated

HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT:

The bidding firm as indicated below, it's officers and members shall, through the signing of this document by any
authorized party or agent, indemnify, hold harmless and defend Charlotte County, a political subdivision of the State of
Florida, its officers, agents, employees, and volunteers from all suits and actions, including attorney’s fees and all costs of
litigation and judgment of every name and description brought against the County as a result of loss, damage or injury to
person or property by reason of any act or failure to act by the bidding firm, its agents, servants or employees.

Type of Organization (Please Check One):  Individual Ownership Joint Venture
Partnership ______ Corporation _ »
Name of Bidding Firm _(_Ron Precly o tiovs De@incgs
1
Mailing Address 200 Heroes Lanse

Location Address O\ OO MQOJQSS ey

City & State H_u_(bm‘. fFL 2P 33RLO
Telephone 552 a;& Qéﬁss FaxNumberB& =

Signature of person authorized to bind the Company:

Print Name/Title of person authorized to bind the Company: W’a)ar Owen Director of VM & Forestry

Date: May 16th, 2014

(This form to be returned)

17 Bid No. 2014000308



SOURCE OF SUPPLY AND SUBCONTRACTORS

The following sources of supply and subcontractors shall be used for the INSECTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY &
DELIVER project. If bidder does not have a source of supply or subcontractor, insert “to be determined”. When a source
or subcontractor is determined, selection will be subject to County approval. (If not applicable, state N/A).

Source of Supply Subcontractor(s)
1 1
2, A 2, A
o AJIA o /T
| =1 !
4, 4
8 5

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE FORM

The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that _Crop Production Services, Inc.

(name of business) does:

6.

Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or
use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against
employees for violations of such prohibition.

Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-
free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the
penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations.

Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of
the statement specified in subsection (1).

In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the
commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and
will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or
of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no
later than five (5) days after such conviction.

Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program
if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.

Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, | certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.
Signature ,!// _~__Wayhe Owen

! L
Dated y 16, 2014

(This form to be returned)

19 Bid No. 2014000308



Dan Bergeson, Aquatic Specialist, P.O. Box 625, Safety Harbor, FL 34695
Phone: (813) 267-5650

January 3, 2014
To Whom It May Concern:
This is to inform you that CPS (Crop Production Services), is an authorized distributor for

SePro® products, in the state of Florida.

If | can be of further assistance or clarification, please let me know.

Best Regards,
Dan Bergeson, Aquatics Specialist



A

Turf & Specialty 240 Inverness Shores Drive
Fayetteville, GA 30215

January 6, 2014

Mr. Joe Collins

Crop Production Services.
2100 Moores Lane
Mulberry, FL 33860

Dear Mr. Collins,

This letter is to verify that Crop Production Services is an authorized distributor
for Nufarm Turf and Specialty. CPS has the ability to quote prices and deliver products
for Nufarm Turf and Specialty with in the State of Florida.

Sincerely,
Clark Boyd

VM Sales Manager, Southeast
770-719-8180



Monsanto Company
1089 Forsythia Lane
West Palm Beach, FL 33415

January 5, 2014

Mr. Joe Collins

Crop Production Services
2100 Moores lane
Mulberry, F1. 33860

Dear Joe:

Per your request, this letter confirms that Crop Production Services, is a Florida
distributor of Monsanto products. If you need any further information, please contact me.

Thank you for your support of Monsanto products.
Sincerely,
Justine Yancey

ITO Chemical Sales Representative
352-304-9496 Cell



e —

S et
Loveland
INDUSTRIES LTD

PO Box 1289 - Greeley Co. 80632

To whom it may concern;

This is a letter to confirm that, Crop Production Services (CPS), is a distributor for all
Loveland (LPI) Industries LTD products.

Sincerely,

Moe Finke
National Sales Rep.

Loveland Representative
618-292-9929



applied biochemists

a business of Arch Chemicals, Inc.
W175 N11163 Stonewood Dr., Ste. 234, Germantown, Wi 53022, 1-800-558-5106, 262-255-4449

01/30/2014

Joe Collins

Sales/Government Account Coordinator
Crop Production Services

Timberland Division

Dear Mr. Collins:

This letter confirms Crop Protection Services (CPS) is a current and gualifying Distributor of
Applied Biochemists’ products within all regions of the U.S.

— L

/ James C Schmidt
V. P. Sales & Marketing
Applied Biochemists
a business of Arch Chemicals, Inc.

Sincerely,

cc. Harry Knight



BID FORM
PESTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY & DELIVER
BID NO. 2014000308

TO: Senior Division Manager - Purchasing
Board of County Commissioners
Charlotte County Administration Center
18500 Murdock Circle
Port Charlotte, FI. 33948-1094

The undersigned, as bidder, does hereby declare that he has read the Request for Bids, Instructions to Bidders, Technical
Specifications & Conditions, Safety & Health Requirements, Bid Form, and any other documentation for

INSECTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY & DELIVER

and further agrees to furnish all items listed on the attached Bid Form in accordance with the unit price(s) submitted. The
above specified documents are herein incorporated into the Bid Form and shall be defined as the contract documents.

Please indicate by (V) that you have included the following documentation with your bid:

( /) Material Safety Data Sheets (MSDS) and Labels

( /) Proof of Authorized Florida Distributor: All Bidders must provide statement from manufacturer of any/all
product(s) bid, showing Bidder to be an authorized distributor within the State of Florida for said product.

( /f Business Tax Receipt: (Only required if claiming status as a “local Business” and must be valid for at
least six (6) months prior to the bid submission)

Local Business Status: If Bidder affirms that it is a local business as defined in 1B-26 and in accordance with Ordinance
2009-005 adopted by the Charlotte County Board of Commissioners and filed with the Secretary of State on February 17,
2009, and Ordinance 2009-041 adopted by the Charlotte County Board of Commissioners and filed with the Secretary of
State on October 19, 2009, then the Affidavit Claiming Status as a Local Business, which is included as a part of this bid
package, must be completed and returned.

Yes, our business qualifies as a Local Business and has completed and attached the ‘Affidavit Claiming Status as a
Local Business’ as a part of our submission.

){ No, our business does not qualify as a Local Business.

NOTE: Charlotte County's official bid openings are open to the public. Citizens and submitting bidders are encouraged to
attend. However, if you are unable to attend but wish to obtain the unofficial bid results, you may do so by visiting our
website at www.charlottecountyfl. com/purchasing under “Purchasing Bids On-Line”, Document Number 143084. No
information regarding the submittal will be divulged over the telephone.

PIGGYBACK CLAUSE: It is understood and agreed by Charlotte County and the successful bidder(s) that any local
governmental entity in the County of Charlotte may purchase the materials and services specified herein in accordance
with the prices submitted by the successful bidder(s). It is also understood and agreed that each local entity will establish
its own contract with a successful bidder, place its own orders, be invoiced therefrom and make its own payments to the
successful bidder in accordance with the terms of the contract established between the local governmental entity and the
successful bidder. It is also hereby mutually understood and agreed that Charlotte County is not a legally bound party to
any contractual agreement made between a successful bidder and any local entity other than Charlotte County Board of
County Commissioners.

~The bidder hereby_agrees_to the_.above stated provisions of the piggyback clause: YES X NO

NAME OF BIDDER \/\l 1 r\—g el d SO \k_i‘\/l ONS

(This form to be returned)

14 Bid No. 2014000308



PRICES:

1. DIBROM CONCENTRATE Product Name:

$_ 0 I IE /galion Package Size: Days for Delivery:;
2. ALTOSID BRIQUETS — 150 Day Product Name:

$ IM 12) Icase Package Size: Days for Delivery:
3. ALTOSID LIQUID (5%) Product Name:

$ ( }M ]/’2 /gallon Package Size: Days for Delivery:
4. B.T.I Product Name:

$ “ ﬁ “3; /gallon Package Size: Days for Delivery:
5, PERMETHRIN 30/30 Product Name:

$ ‘15\ { 6 /Mini Tote Package Size: Days for Delivery:
8. ALTOSID PELLETS Product Name:

$ Iﬂr ! !& /44 pound case Days for Delivery:
7. ANVIL 10/10 Product Name:

3 NJ % /275 gallon mini-tote Days for Delivery:

container

8. ZENIVEX Product Name:

$ /30 gallon container Days for Delivery:

:

9.  CAPTAINXTR Procuct Name.__ (" n{)\d\ n_ X TR

5

$ ¢ /2.5 gallon container  Days for Delivery: '%

10.  REWARD Product Name:___ )¢, hun e
. O
$_J Q( ) -~ /2.5 gallon container ~ Package Size:f)l'/ n ot DS  Days for Delivery: ,C'_z
11. CUTRINE PLUS ALGAECIDE-LIQUID Product Name: CLLJ«T"\ ne p\ uS

Y , el ) [y
$ ;5 15 /2.5 gallon container  Package Size: 2.5 3 Days for Delivery:__ O
12. CUTRINE PLUS ALGAECIDE GRANULAR Product Name: QKK‘\?\"! Ne ‘g \ us G 2
l
5_o S !30 pound bags Package Size: 36 . Days for Delivery: L
C\
13.  SONARAS Product Name:____onar B S
3le
$\IC‘OI, 9. /gallon Package Size; \ S(‘ﬂ\hn Days for Delivery:_s_

NAME OF BIDDER Wﬂi Y\S’T(“‘\d 80\ \HJ oNsS

(This form to be returned)
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PRICES (Continued)

E;ﬂtf\a\" Sp?\

14. SONAR SPR Product Name:

$ 2)0 e iL\ / pound Package Size: Days for Delivery: S
15.  GARLON 3A Productame:__ Colevaaind 3

$ é ) - Bq /gallon Package Size: Days for Delivery: S
16. FOAM BUSTER Product Name:

$_ | }t{ l& /pint Package Size: Days for Delivery:
17.  MARKER DYE Product Name:___NOWN.SY(Q

$ Q 3 . SO /gallon Package Size:_gi/@m& Days for Delivery: 5
18. 90/10 Non-lonic Spreader/Sticker Product Name: D\G\ 10 K.\ NQ_—

$_ A3 co /gallon Package Size__( (/Q > Dayass for Delivery: S
19.  DRIFT CONTROL AGENT Product Name: S\} ndetic,

$ é’Z QS:}/gallon Package Size: laadlenr Days for Delivery:
20. AQUATIC GLYPHOS Product Name: v ‘QO()\ e

$ Iq s \0 /gallon Package Size: o’? '/Q e ) Days for Delivery: 5
21. AVAST Product Name:

$ | &"2 /gallon Package Size: Days for Delivery:
22 NATULAR G Product Name:

$_ N/ /401b. bag Days for Delivery:
23. NATULAR XRG Product Name:

$ p( / Ib /40 Ib. bag Days for Delivery:
24. NATULAR 2EC Product Name:

$ !5[ Z L& /2x2.5 gal case Days for Delivery:
25. NATULAR T30 Product Name:

$ 15‘ Z ré /400 tablet case Days for Delivery:
26. NATULAR XRT Product Name:

$_{ Jz 6 /220 tablet case Days for Delivery:
NAME OF BIDDER \/\(( Y\gﬁl‘\(‘l S&\u\l«i ons

(This form to be returned)

16
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If notified of the acceptance of this bid form, the undersigned agrees to execute a Contract for the stated compensation in
the form as prescribed by the County, within the time constraints outlined in Instructions to Bidders.

The signature below is a guarantee that the Bidder will not withdraw his/her bid for a period of sixty (60) days after the
scheduled time for opening the bids.

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following addenda, and the cost, if any, of such revisions has been included
in the price bid.

Addendum No. , Dated ; Addendum No. , Dated ; Addendum No. , Dated
Addendum No. , Dated : Addendum No. , Dated ;  Addendum No. , Dated

HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT:

The bidding firm as indicated below, it's officers and members shall, through the signing of this document by any
authorized party or agent, indemnify, hold harmless and defend Charlotte County, a political subdivision of the State of
Florida, its officers, agents, employees, and volunteers from all suits and actions, including attorney’s fees and all costs of
litigation and judgment of every name and description brought against the County as a result of loss, damage or injury to
person or property by reason of any act or failure to act by the bidding firm, its agents, servants or employees.

Type of Organization (Please Check One):  Individual Ownership Joint Venture
Partnershlp Corporation X

Name of Bidding Firm W \ r\‘\:e l R 3{\\ U*L:’( onsS

Mailing Address Q| \/\. anac Blessrm T ﬁa;ok() £L 32713
Location Address (O] ${‘xu\ Pﬁ\\thaﬁ L\uo\l

City & State Vant ¢ S z2r__ 323504
Telephone LI T- Slaly - SS{MW Fax Number 07 - E8H ¢ [ (L

E-mail S‘gr_\‘,QHe rs® Londblakes. COMm .

Signature of person authorized to bind the Company: q MZ’M A U\\dﬂm

{
Print Name/Title of person authorized to bind the Company: S—L&J‘_’) h@u‘ﬂl £ '/\\(1\‘\6 (s (‘BJOLF Ao W\S& .

Date: 5’) QUL ! QC\J\L]_

(This form to be returned)
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AFFIDAVIT
Claiming Status as a Local Business

Bidder affirms that it is a local business as defined below and in accordance with the following: Ordinance 2009-005
adopted by the Charlotte County Board of Commissioners and filed with the Secretary of State on February 17, 2009; and
Ordinance 2009-041 adopted by the Charlotte County Board of Commissioners and filed with the Secretary of State on
October 19, 2009.

A. Local Business Definition:

Local business means the company has a valid Business Tax Receipt issued by Charlotte County, Sarasota County
or DeSoto County for af least six months prior to the bid submission to do business within Charlotte County, Sarasota
County or DeSoto Courity that authorizes the business to provide the services or goods, and a physical business
address located within the\imits of Charlotte County, Sarasota County or DeSoto County from which the business
operates or performs business. Post Office Boxes are not verifiable and shall not be used for the purpose of
establishing said physical address. In addition to the foregoing, a business shall not be considered having a “Local
Business” unless it contributes to.the economic development and well-being of these Counties in a verifiable and
measurable way. Vendors shall affirm in writing their compliance with the foregoing at the time of submitting their bid
to be eligible for consideration as having a “Local Business”. A business that misrepresents the local preference
status of its company in a bid to the County.) wili lose the privilege to claim local preference for a one year period.

B. Competitive bid (local price match optlon)
Each formal competitive bid solicitation shall clearly-identify how the price order of the bids received will be evaluated
and determined. When a responsive, responsible hon- -local business submits the lowest price bid, and the bid
submitted by one or more responsive, responsible local\businesses, as defined below, is within five percent of the
price submitted by the non-local business, each of the afg‘r entioned local businesses shall have the opportunity to
submit, a best and final bid equal to or lower than the/amo t of the low bid previously submitted by the non-local
business within five days of being notified by the Semor Division Manager of Purchasing in writing. Contract award
shall be made to the responsive, responsible busineés submitting the lowest best and final bid. In the case of a tie in
the best and final bid between a local business gnd a non-local busipess, contract award shall be made to the local
business.

If requested by the County, the bidder will be ;e’ciuired to provide documentation substantiating the information given in
this affidavit. Charlotte County reserves the right to request supporting documgptation as evidence to substantiate the
information given in this affidavit. Failure to do so will result in the bidder’s submissign being deemed non-responsive.

Company Name: /
Signature: / N
Title: __ /.
/
r';
Year Business Established: Circle the appropriate County: Charlotte DeSoto Sarasota

/
State of Florida /

County of

Sworn to and sub'écribed before me, a Notary Public, for the above State and County on this day of
, 20

Notary Public Commission Expiration

(Affix Official Seal)
The signee of this Affidavit guarantees, as evidenced by the sworn affidavit required herein, the truth and accuracy of this
affidavit to interrogatories hereinafter made.

This page to be returned only if Contractor is claiming a Local Business Status.
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SOURCE OF SUPPLY AND SUBCONTRACTORS

The following sources of supply and subcontractors shall be used for the INSECTICIDES & HERBICIDES - SUPPLY &
DELIVER project. If bidder does not have a source of supply or subcontractor, insert “to be determined”. When a source
or subcontractor is determined, selection will be subject to County approval. (If not applicable, state N/A).

Source of Supply Subcontractor(s)
1. 1
2 2.
3 3
4 4.
) 5.

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE FORM

The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 hereby certifies that \/\} ( N 2 ld SD\L(\L O
(name of business) does:

1. ‘Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession, or
use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against
employees for violations of such prohibition.

2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-
free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the
penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations.

3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of
the statement specified in subsection (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the
commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and
will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 893 or
of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no
later than five (5) days after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program
if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.

6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, | certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.

Signature Q&@‘/ﬂ,ﬂ( )] {thm

Dated S/ ) :7 ]/ 0] L‘\‘

(This form to be returned)
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